

CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT OF NEW ROCHELLE  
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
515 NORTH AVENUE  
NEW ROCHELLE, NEW YORK 10801

**AWARD BOOK**

**NOTICE TO BIDDERS No. 4482-19**

**MASONRY SUPPLIES – DISTRICT WIDE**

**PRICES FIRM THROUGH:** October 3, 2018 October 2, 2019 (with two additional one year option to extend)

**COMPANY NAME & ADDRESS**

Sammarco Stone and Supply, Inc.  
173 Oak Street  
New Rochelle, NY 10801

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	SAMMARCO
1	CEMENT ADDITIVE, ACRYLIC 60	\$ 20.53
2	CEMENT, ANCHORING	\$ 10.98
3	ANGLE IRON, SIZE: 3"x4"x48"	\$ 20.24
4	BLOCK, BELGIAN, 4"X4"X8"	\$ 1.98
5	BLADES, BIMETAL BLADES, 14 TOOTH, 14TPI	\$ 2.00
6	BLACKTOP, SIZE: 60 LB BAG	\$ 6.83
7	BOLT CUTTER, 18", INDUSTRIAL/CONTRACTOR QUALITY	\$ 17.50
8	BOLT CUTTER, 36", INDUSTRIAL/CONTRACTOR QUALITY	\$ 29.72
9	BRICK PAVERS	\$ 0.62
10	BRICK, COMMON STANDARD SOLID	\$ 0.63
11	BROOM, WITH HANDLE, BROWN H.D. COARSE-SWEEPING 16" HARDWOOD BLOCK FOR SWEEPING CONCRETE	\$ 13.95
12	CAULKING GUN, INDUSTRIAL SUPER RATCHET SIZE: 10.3 OZ	\$ 4.75
13	CEMENT, PORTLAND. (SPECIAL NOTE: this item and item #62 for bagged <u>SAND</u> will be awarded to same vendor to facilitate our pick-up)	\$ 9.30
14	CHALK-RITE LINE	\$ 8.08
15	BLOCK, CONCRETE 10", 8"X18" HOLLOW	\$ 2.28
16	BLOCK, CONCRETE 12", 8"X18" HOLLOW	\$ 2.61
17	BLOCK, CONCRETE 4", 8"X18" HOLLOW	\$ 1.40
18	BLOCK, CONCRETE 6", 8"X18" HOLLOW	\$ 1.43
19	BLOCK, CONCRETE 8", 8"X18" HOLLOW	\$ 1.76

20	CONCRETE BONDING AGENT, ACRYLIC ADDITIVE. SIZE: 5 GAL CAN	\$ 40.57
21	CONCRETE BONDING AGENT, ACRYLIC ADDITIVE. SIZE: 1 GAL CAN	\$ 10.14
22	CONCRETE BRICK	\$ 0.67
23	CONCRETE FLOATS, STANDARD, RUBBER	\$ 5.21
24	CONCRETE FLOATS, STANDARD, WOOD	\$ 5.83
25	CROW BAR, WRECKING BAR 24"	\$ 7.26
26	DURA-BOND, BASE & BONDING AGENT FOR PLASTER FINISHES. SIZE: GALLON CAN	\$ 21.30
27	EXPANSION JOINT STRIPS, 1/2"X4"X10'	\$ 2.70
28	FLAGSTONE, 12"X4'X2"	\$ 54.00
29	FOUNDATION COATING, SIZE: 5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 46.20
30	FOUNDATION COATING, SIZE: 1 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 14.95
31	GARDEN HOSE, 50' H.D.ONLY	\$ 23.36
32	GAUGING PLASTER, SIZE: 50 LB BAG	\$ 21.41
33	GRAVEL, 3/4" BLUE STONE BY/YARD	\$ 46.19
34	GRAVEL, SIZE: 50 LB BAG	\$ 2.03
35	WIRES, HEAVY GAUGE, 6 GAUGE MESH, 5X10	\$ 14.23
36	LEVEL, 2' WOOD	\$ 49.52
37	LEVEL, 4' WOOD	\$ 59.40
38	LIME, COMMON, 50 LB BAG	
39	LIME, FINISHING, SIZE: 50 LB BAG	\$ 16.95
40	HAMMER, MASONARY 16 OZ BRICK HAMMER	\$ 10.18
41	HAMMER, MASONARY 24 OZ. STEEL BRICKLAYER HAMMER WITH VIBRATION REDUCING GRIP	\$ 35.22
42	CHISEL, MASONS, 4" CUTTING SURFACE,	\$ 15.86
43	CHISEL, MASONS, 9"X3"	\$ 9.04
44	MASONS MIXING TUB, H.D STANDARD SIZE	\$ 94.68
45	MASONS TROWEL, SIZE: 7"X4-3/8"	\$ 10.99
46	METAL SNIPS, 12" INDUSTRIAL CONTRACTOR QUALITY	\$ 10.47
47	MORTAR LITE	\$ 8.95
48	MORTAR MIX, SIZE: 80 LB BAG	\$ 5.47
49	MURIATIC ACID SIZE: 1 GAL	\$ 7.64
50	PVC CEMENT, CAN	\$ 4.54
51	PVC PRIMER, CAN	\$ 3.83
52	PICK, ROCK PICK, 22 OZ. WITH VINYL GRIP	\$ 33.20
53	PLASTER WELD, SIZE: GAL CONTAINER	\$ 19.28
54	TROWEL, POINTING TROWEL, WITH WOOD HANDLE, POLISHED STEEL FERRULE, SIZE: 6"x2-3/4"	\$ 8.30

55	RAKE, CONTRACTOR GRADE FIBERGLASS HANDLE,H.D. BOW RAKE FOR GRAVEL USE	\$ 34.21
56	RAKE, CONTRACTOR GRADE FIBERGLASS HANDLE, H.D. LEVEL RAKE FOR GRAVEL USE	\$ 39.11
57	REINFORCING RODS, 1/2"X10'	\$ 5.38
58	REINFORCING RODS, 5/8"X20'	\$ 11.10
59	ROLL STRING LINE, YELLOW MASONS LINE, 1000 FT ROLL	\$ 6.41
60	ROOFING CEMENT, TROWEL TAR, PLASTIC 5 GAL CONTAINER	\$ 46.20
61	SAND, BY YARD	\$ 49.78
62	SAND & GRAVEL MIX, BY YARD	\$ 46.36
63	SAND, SIZE: 50 LB BAG. (SPECIAL NOTE: this item and item #13 for bagged CEMENT will be awarded to same vendor to facilitate our pick-up)	\$ 2.25
64	SANDLOCK, SIZE: 70 LB BAG	\$ 20.83
65	SHOVEL, CONTRACTORS GRADE H.D. GARDEN SPADE, FIBERGLASS HANDLE, 16 GA BLADE	\$ 25.01
66	SILICONE CAULK, 100%, G.E. 35 YR., TUBE	\$ 3.78
67	SILICONE, SIZE: 5 GAL CONTAINER	NO BID
68	SLATE, CUSTOM CUT, PRICED PER FOOT, 2"X12"X72"	\$ 11.89
69	SPONGE, LG COMMERCIAL, 6"X4-1/4"X1-5/8"	\$ 2.51
70	STRUCTOLITE, SIZE: 50 LB BAG	\$ 17.38
71	TAPE, YELLOW CAUTION, 3"X1000' ROLL	\$ 7.86
72	TAR PAPER, 50' ROLL	\$ 23.06
73	TIE WIRE, 16 GA METAL, 330' ROLL	\$ 4.48
74	WD-40, 12 OZ CAN	\$ 5.35
75	WALL TIES, 28 GA, 500/PCS BOX	\$ 21.96
76	WALL PATCH, 4"X4"	NO BID
77	WALL PATCH, 6"X6"	NO BID
78	WALL PATCH, 8"X8"	NO BID
79	WATER SEALANT, GALLON	\$ 72.16
80	WELDCRETE, GALLON	\$ 19.58
81	BLADES, 12" WET SAW BLADE, DIAMOND CUTTING	\$ 75.00
82	BLADES, 4" WET SAW BLADE, DIAMOND CUTTING	\$ 10.80
83	BLADES, 8" WET SAW BLADE, DIAMOND CUTTING	\$ 29.26
84	WHEEL BARREL, H.D. METAL, STAND.SIZE	\$ 106.65
85	WIRE LATH, GALVANIZED 3.4 GA DIAMOND, 10 SHEETS PER BUNDLE	\$ 83.40
86	MISCELLANEOUS MATERIALS NOT LISTED IN ANY LINE ITEM ABOVE	15%